REGULAR MEETING OF THE MISHAWAKA
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS AND SAFETY/UTILITY BOARD
March 12, 2013

The regular meeting of the Board of Public Works and Safety/Utility Board was called to
order by President Gary West. All members were present except Mr. Watson. Mr. Prince
moved to dispense with the reading of the minutes of March 5, 2013, and accept them as
circulated. Mr. West seconded; motion carried.

Bid/Quote Openings:
Bids were opened for accessories for up to nine (9) Police patrol cars and are summarized

below:

Waymire Fleet

Galls LLC Equipment S.R. Jenkins Co., Inc.
Delivery 35-40 days 45 days 45 days
Discount 32.04% 25% 0%
ltems Unit price/total Unit price/total Unit price/total
Item #1 $1,245.90/%$6,234.50 $977.50/$4,887.50 $855.00/$4,275.00
Item #2 $202.10/$3,637.80 $118.45/$1,066.05 $475.56/$4,280.04
Item #3 $177.35/$2,837.60 $100.45/$1,608.96 $166.88/$2,670.08
Item #4 $90.10/$810.90 $56.70/$510.30 $69.00/$621.00
Item #5 $172.50/$1,552.50 $120.75/$1,086.75 $163.00/$1,467.00
Dynamax bracket $13.51/$121.59
Item #6 — RED $122.35/$489.40 $66.00/$264.00 $73.00/$292.00
Item #6 — BLUE $122.35/$489.40 $66.00/$264.00 $88.00/$352.00
Item #7 — RED $96.75/$387.00 $139.24/$556.96 $148.50/$594.40
Item #7 - BLUE $96.75/$387.00 $139.24/$556.96 $148.50/$594.00
Item #8 No bid $30.00/$270.00 No bid
Item #9 $438.75/$3,948.75 $507.58/$4,568.22 $467.50/$4,207.50
Item #10 $151.21/$1,360.89 $209.07/$1,881.63 $219.00/$1,971.00
Iltem #11 $312.50/$2,500.00 $172.50/$1,380.00 $171.00/$1,368.00
Item #12 $419.30/$2,096.50 $513.94/$2,569.70 No bid
Item #13 No bid $311.77/$2,805.93 No bid

Mr. West said the bids will be forwarded to the Police Department for their review and

evaluation.

Bids were opened for twenty-one (21) electric powered golf carts and are summarized

below:

VENDOR

Midwest Golf & Turf, Noblesville, IN

MODEL: 2013 Precedent Electric Golf Carts $4,175.00 X 21 $87,675.00
TRADE-IN: (14) 2010 models -21,000.00
TRADE-IN: (5) 2007 models - 7,000.00
TOTAL LESS TRADE-INS $59,675.00
DELIVERY: 60 days

DISCOUNT: 0%

Professional Golfcar Corporation, Bloomington, IN

MODEL: 2013 E-Z-GO TXT 48 $3,995.00 X 21 $83,895.00
TRADE-IN: (14) 2010 models -23,800.00
TRADE-IN: (5) 2007 models - 5,875.00
TOTAL LESS TRADE-INS $54,220.00




DELIVERY: 60-90 days
DISCOUNT: 0%

Mr. West said the bids will be forwarded to the Parks Department for their review and
evaluation.

One quote was opened for three (3) monitor/defibrillators for the Fire Department and is
summarized below:

VENDOR
Physio-Control, Inc., Redmond, WA
MODEL: LIFEPAK 15 v2 360 joules $28,300.75 X 3 $92,322.45

DELIVERY: 45 days
DISCOUNT: 15%

Mr. West said this quote will be forwarded to the Fire Department for their review and
evaluation.

No quotes were received for Fire Sprinkler System Repairs at 700 S. Union Street.

Mayor’s Comments:
Mayor Wood announced a staff meeting would follow today’s Board meeting.

Department Head Reports:
Park Superintendent Terry Zeller submitted a request to remove one tree and stump in the
right of way at 803 Grand Blvd. The tree has been analyzed and recommended for removal
by the Park Department Landscaper. Mr. Prince moved to approve as presented. Mr. West
seconded; motion carried.

City Planner Ken Prince on behalf of Street Commissioner Mike Watson requested the Board
authorize the receipt of quotes for asbestos abatement at 700 S. Union Street for Central
Services to be opened March 19, 2013, and moved for its approval. Mr. West seconded;
motion carried.

Engineering Director Gary West requested the Board award the Wilson Boulevard Area
Combined Sewer Outfall Consolidation project to HRP Construction, the lowest most
responsive, responsible bidder, in the amount of $2,473,300.00, and moved for its
approval. Mr. Prince seconded; motion carried.

Mr. West requested the Board accept a 30’ wide storm drainage overflow easement from
Autumn Ridge Phase | basin to Dodge landfill site from Cleveland Woods Development, and
moved for its approval. Mr. Prince seconded; motion carried.

Mr. West requested the Board approve plans and authorize the receipt of bids for West
Street Storm Sewer Phase 1B (First Street-Front Street) to be opened April 2, 2013, and
moved for its approval. Mr. Prince seconded; motion carried.

Approval of Claims:
There were no claims to approve.

Approval of SRF Pay Applications:
There were no applications to approve.




New Business:
A request from Bike the Bend to hold their annual family event on Sunday, May 19, 2013,
using Riverwalk, Central, Merrifield, and Crawford Parks was taken under advisement.

A request from Tilted Kilt at 1032 University Drive for a Waiver of Noise Ordinance on
Saturday, March 16, 2013, for live music in tent beginning at 6:00 p.m. until midnight, and
Sunday, March 17, 2013, for DJ and live remote broadcast from 12:00 p.m. until 6:00 p.m.
Mr. Prince moved to approve subject to normal public safety conditions and that live music
end at 12:00 a.m. Mr. West seconded; motion carried.

Old Business:

Mr. West moved to deny the request from ABATE of Indiana to use Beutter Park for staging
of their annual MDA motorcycle ride on Sunday, September 1, 2013, due to the site being
inadequate for the event. Mr. Prince seconded; motion carried.

Mr. West moved to approve a request to use the Mishawaka Riverwalk for the Sunburst
Marathon, 6:00 a.m. — 12:30 p.m., Saturday, June 1, 2013. Mr. Prince seconded; motion
carried.

A request for Notice of Recognition of Encroachment submitted by Bethel College for
installation of a directional sign on Lowell Avenue continued under advisement.

Administrative approval of Second Hand Store License Renewal received from Julie’s Used
Appliances, 2302 Lincolnway West, continued under advisement due to previous building
and zoning deficiencies identified on the property.

A request submitted by ASAP Towing Services for Towing Services Contract continued under
advisement.

Unfinished Business:
There being no additional business brought before the Board, the meeting was adjourned at
10:46 a.m.

Gary West - President of the Board of
Public Works and Safety/Utility Board

Kari Myers - Clerk of the Board of
Public Works and Safety/Utility Board



